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Item Description
10' Cat 5 network patch cable
25' Cat 5 network patch cable
6' usb cables
Belkin 6 Outlet Surgestrip
Brother 2820 Intellifax Laser
Brother 4750 fax machine
EV-200 Mobile Visual Presenter
HP 2420 Laser printer
HP 2420DN Laser printer duplex/network
HP 2550N Color Laser printer network
HP 3700DN Color Laser printer dup/netwk
HP 3940 Deskjet printer
HP 4350TN B/W Laser Printer
HP 4850 Scanijet
HP 5610 Officejet All-In-One
Infocus X2 Projector #INF-X2
Memorex 1GB USB Flashdrive
Memorex 2GB USB Flashdrive
Sony Battery Charger (for NP-F330)
Sony Camera battery rechargeable
Sony Cybershot DSC-S40 digital camera
Sony Flash Memory card 128MB
Sony USB Mouse/Memory stick reader
Western Digital 7200rpm 40gb Caviar
Plantronics Headset
Plantronics Headset
Lifter for Plantronics Headset
Palmone Tungsten E2
LifeDrive Mobile MaNo Bidger Handheld
Cradle kit for LifeDrive
Universal Wireless Palm keyboard

Alt1 HP 3800DN #Q5983A
Alt 2 Sony DSC-600
Alt 3 HP 2600N Q6455A

Box denotes alternate part number quoted
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Low Price
1.53
3.41
1.45
5.79

179.89

425.00

419.00

475.00

748.21

517.59

$1,124.00

$ 44.00

$1,524.00

114.61

130.17

685.00

50.00
88.75
39.47
2451
145.00
21.18
19.27
45.68
164.64
161.90
42.96
174.00
376.00
25.60
43.40

859.50

181.08

299.00
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GRAND PRAIRIE INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

QUOTE # Q013006
Computer Computer Gov Global
BCS LandTx Tech Connec Tech Depot Gov Ed West Tech SHI
$ 306 $ 475 $ 305 $ 18 $ 455 $ 300 $ 300 $ 271
$ 510 $ 1400 $ 532 $ 345 $ 509 $ 600 $ 500 $ 451
$ 273 $ 700 $ 273 $ 145 $ 300 $ 250 $ 300 $ 410
$ 878 $ 1199 $ 650 $ 650 $ 725 $ 782 $ 800 $ 579
$ 187.42 $ 21200 $ 187.99 $ 18025 $ 191.00 $ 184.00 $ 20500 $ 180.92
$ 441.94 $ 480.00 $ 44327 $ 427.00 $ 449.00 $ 430.00 $ 450.00 $ 559.71
No Bid NoBid $ 43500 $ 537.00 $ 470.00 NoBid $ 473.00
$ 542,60 $ 51200 $ 509.61 $ 509.00 $ 490.00 $ 511.00 $ 486.00 $ 481.68
$ 85958 $ 81200 $ 81569 $ 81400 $ 783.00 $ 816.00 $ 778.00 '$ 748.21
$ 57863 $ 569.00 $ 588.10 NoBid No Bid NoBid [$ 595.00|$ 517.59
NoBid $ 1,183.00  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$ 5101 $ 4600 $ 4682 $ 4700 $ 4699 $ 5100 $ 4500 $ 44.14
$1,817.60 $ 1,735.00 $ 1,742.73 $1,722.00 $ 1,675.00 | $1,524.00 $1,668.00 $1,655.28
$ 123.90 $ 13000 $ 13453 $ 13500 $ 126.00 $ 13550 $ 127.00 $ 119.83
$ 14544 $ 141.00 $ 14086 $ 14200 $ 133.00 $ 149.00 $ 13400 $ 132.75
$ 768.35 $ 761.00 $ 743.00 $ 716.00 [$ 695.00| $ 738.50 $ 765.00 $ 731.40
$ 6668 $ 69.00[$ 5167|% 6600($ 5800|% 50.00[$ 5300|$ 59.19
$ 11619 $ 11000 $ 9404 $ 98.00[$ 127.00 | $ 107.00 $ 100.00 $ 88.75
$ 3947]$% 10300 NoBid NoBid $ 9016 $ 8500 NoBid No Bid
$ 2451|$ 49.00 NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NoBid | $ 14500  No Bid NoBid $ 187.00  No Bid No Bid No Bid
$ 2423 $ 2800 $ 2269 $ 2300 NoBid $ 2350 $ 27.00 $ 21.30
NoBid $  60.00[$ 19.27]| NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$ 5053 $ 59.00 $ 4731 $ 4700 $ 6600 $ 5600 $ 59.00 $ 51.34
$ 17628 $ 17700 $ 17252 $ 175.00[$ 217.00] $ 170.00 $ 179.00 $ 167.30
$ 17524 $ 169.00 $ 168.70 $ 170.00 $ 173.00 $ 164.00 $ 178.00 '$ 161.90
$ 5003 $ 5200 $ 4891 $ 4soom$ 4400 $ 49.00 $ 42,96
$ 180.99 $ 18500 $ 177.39 $ 178.00 183.00 $ 180.00 $ 189.00 $ 175.50
$ 38956 $ 399.00 $ 383.93 $ 384.00 $ 44000 $ 389.00 $ 402.00 $ 377.00
$ 2774 $ 3200 $ 2600 $ 2700 $ 3200 $ 2900 $ 36.00 $ 26.04
$ 4827 $ 5200 $ 4549 $ 47.00 $ 4400 $ 4700 $ 56.00 ' $ 43.40
$1,190.21  NoBid  $ 1,084.72 $1,149.00 $ 1,159.00 | $ 859.50 $1,145.00  No Bid
No Bid NoBid $ 186.24  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid [$ 299.00 $ 376.00 No Bid No Bid
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Item Description
10' Cat 5 network patch cable
25' Cat 5 network patch cable
6' usb cables
Belkin 6 Outlet Surgestrip
Brother 2820 Intellifax Laser
Brother 4750 fax machine
EV-200 Mobile Visual Presenter
HP 2420 Laser printer
HP 2420DN Laser printer duplex/network
HP 2550N Color Laser printer network
HP 3700DN Color Laser printer dup/netwk
HP 3940 Deskjet printer
HP 4350TN B/W Laser Printer
HP 4850 Scanijet
HP 5610 Officejet All-In-One
Infocus X2 Projector #INF-X2
Memorex 1GB USB Flashdrive
Memorex 2GB USB Flashdrive
Sony Battery Charger (for NP-F330)
Sony Camera battery rechargeable
Sony Cybershot DSC-S40 digital camera
Sony Flash Memory card 128MB
Sony USB Mouse/Memory stick reader
Western Digital 7200rpm 40gb Caviar
Plantronics Headset
Plantronics Headset
Lifter for Plantronics Headset
Palmone Tungsten E2
LifeDrive Mobile MaNo Bidger Handheld
Cradle kit for LifeDrive
Universal Wireless Palm keyboard

Alt1 HP 3800DN #Q5983A
Alt 2 Sony DSC-600
Alt 3 HP 2600N Q6455A

Box denotes alternate part number quoted
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M&A
$ 2.79
$ 4.88
$ 431
$ 9.77
$ 196.00
No Bid
No Bid
$ 548.00
$ 877.00
$ 623.00
$1,333.00
$ 49.00
$1,873.00
139.00
147.00
799.00
66.00
95.00
98.28
151.23
23.00
61.00
60.85
179.00
174.00
53.00
191.24
399.00
28.00
51.27
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
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Troxell HiEd SCW Nu Image Zones

$ 320 $ 231 $ 184 $ 18 $ 191
$ 595 $ 430'$ 341 $ 390 $ 3.9
$ 450 $ 246 $ 153 $ 195 $ 182
$ 1030 $ 753 $ 625 $ 836 $ 579
$ 193.00 $ 189.00 $ 18530 $ 186.86 $ 179.89
$ 44400 $ 44565 $ 434.61 |$ 42500 No Bid

$ 419.00 $1,398.68 [$1,978.22] NoBid $ 468.88
$ 523.00 $ 520.04 $ 523.36 $ 523.00 $ 498.00
$ 81400 $ 82156 $ 78500 $ 821.00 $ 778.00
$ 607.00 $ 602.75 $ 579.41 NoBid $ 572.00
No Bid NoBid $1,19659 NoBid  No Bid

$ 5600 $ 5192 $ 4500 $ 5200 $ 4898
$1,742.00 $1,755.29 $1,678.00 $1,700.00 $1,692.00
$ 141.00 $ 14035 '$ 11461 $ 143.00 $ 135.00
$ 151.00 $ 14721 $ 138.18 $ 150.00 $ 138.00
$ 74200 $ 762.85 $ 748.26 $ 725.00 |$ 685.00
$ 10400[$ 5529|$ 61.85[$ 56.00]$ 63.85
$ 118.00 $ 10063 $ 9470 $ 95.00 No Bid

NoBid $ 9744 NoBid  NoBid $ 40.23
NoBid $ 2496|$ 27.31| NoBid
No Bid NoBid $ 14571 NoBid  NoBid

NoBid $ 2428 $ 2173 $ 2600 $ 23.38
NoBid [$ 2710]$ 7151 NoBid $ 2353
$ 5500 $ 5077 |$ 4568 $ 6200 $ 46.88
NoBid $ 17569 $ 169.87 $ 17200 $ 170.00
NoBid $ 16899 $ 164.13 $ 168.00 $ 165.00
NoBid $ 4889 $ 4743 $ 5300 $ 4500
NoBid $ 180.17 $ 174.66 $ 184.00 $ 178.00
NoBid $ 41677 $ 378.02 $ 383.00 $ 378.00
NoBid $ 27.88 '$ 2560 $ 3600 $ 27.20
NoBid $ 4823 $ 4479 $ 5400 $ 44.00
$1,103.00 $1,108.41 NoBid  $1,105.00 $1,128.00
NoBid '$ 181.08 NoBid $ 183.00 $ 185.00
No Bid No Bid NoBid $ 386.00  No Bid
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PC Mall
Gov
$ 1.53
$ 3.81
$ 1.53
$ 5.90
$ 190.09
No Bid
$ 420.68
$ 511.95
$ 819.41
No Bid
No Bid
$ 4556
No Bid
$ 13141
$ 130.17
$ 760.20
No Bid
$ 115.45
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$ 21.18
No Bid
No Bid
$ 164.64
$ 174.35
$ 44.78
$ 185.31
No Bid
No Bid
$ 44.46
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

MSE
5.00
6.00
7.00
8.00

189.00
436.00
443.00
475.00
760.00
526.00
$1,124.00
$ 44.00
$1,624.00
$ 120.00
$ 131.00
$ 735.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$ 5250

$ 170.00

$ 170.00

$ 49.00

$ 174.00

$

$
$
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376.00
26.00
45.00

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
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