
Logisoft 
Corp BCS SHI  SCW 

 Gov 
Connect  West Tech  HiEd  Alliance 

 Computer 
Express 

 Micro 
Systems  M&A  CompUSA 

Item # Item Description Low Price

1 External CDRW 83.00$        90.63$   92.32$       89.18$       89.90$       88.00$       93.85$      95.00$       No Bid 89.10$         83.00$       89.22$   86.00$       
2 Battery Charger 20.23$        20.23$   28.48$       20.82$       25.06$       22.25$       26.00$      25.50$       No Bid 21.00$         21.00$       21.42$   23.00$       
3 AA Batteries 9.00$          No Bid 13.03$       No Bid 16.70$       No Bid No Bid 17.50$       No Bid 16.32$         12.00$       17.02$   9.00$         
4 Sony Cybershot 182.50$      184.57$ 190.66$     190.00$     190.51$     195.00$     189.00$    189.25$     No Bid 186.80$       185.00$     198.31$ 189.50$     
5 Camera Case 8.85$          No Bid 20.21$       19.53$       23.82$       No Bid No Bid 21.00$       No Bid 8.85$           20.00$       20.60$   21.00$       
6 128 MB Memory Stick 32.24$        32.27$   37.67$       33.00$       36.04$       33.00$       39.00$      33.95$       No Bid 33.00$         33.00$       35.06$   34.50$       
7 Sony Mouse/Memory stick reader 22.00$        24.09$   No Bid 24.94$       26.39$       22.00$       30.00$      26.00$       No Bid 26.00$         26.00$       25.65$   22.10$       
8 HP Business Inkjet 1200DTN 250.00$      261.32$ 287.08$     252.04$     258.00$     250.00$     258.00$    262.00$     No Bid 262.00$       254.00$     272.37$ 281.90$     
9 Cyan Inkjet Cartridge Printhead 26.50$        27.04$   33.21$       26.81$       29.78$       26.50$       30.00$      27.80$       33.00$  28.38$         29.00$       28.58$   30.00$       
10 Magenta Inkjet Cartridge Printhead 26.50$        27.04$   33.21$       26.81$       28.51$       26.50$       30.00$      27.80$       33.00$  28.38$         29.00$       28.58$   30.00$       
11 Black Inkjet Cartridge Printhead 26.50$        27.04$   33.21$       26.81$       28.51$       26.50$       30.00$      27.80$       33.00$  28.38$         29.00$       28.58$   30.00$       
12 Yellow Inkjet Cartridge Printhead 26.50$        27.04$   33.21$       26.81$       28.51$       26.50$       30.00$      27.80$       33.00$  28.38$         29.00$       28.58$   30.00$       
13 External DVD burner 174.99$      178.63$ 197.77$     179.21$     182.45$     175.00$     185.00$    187.50$     No Bid 183.00$       178.00$     189.31$ 188.20$     
14 HP Laserjet 9000dn 3,434.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,471.00$  Refurb No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,686.37$  
15 HP Laserjet 9050dn 3,239.78$   No Bid 3,635.80$  3,239.78$  3,319.00$  3,276.00$  3,319.00$ No Bid No Bid 3,525.00$    3,279.00$  No Bid No Bid
16 Usb cable for an Epson Photopc 3000Z 3.78$          No Bid 3.78$         No Bid 4.85$         No Bid No Bid 11.00$       No Bid 5.75$           6.00$         No Bid 4.45$         
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Item Description Low Price

External CDRW 83.00$        
Battery Charger 20.23$        
AA Batteries 9.00$          
Sony Cybershot 182.50$      
Camera Case 8.85$          
128 MB Memory Stick 32.24$        
Sony Mouse/Memory stick reader 22.00$        
HP Business Inkjet 1200DTN 250.00$      
Cyan Inkjet Cartridge Printhead 26.50$        
Magenta Inkjet Cartridge Printhead 26.50$        
Black Inkjet Cartridge Printhead 26.50$        
Yellow Inkjet Cartridge Printhead 26.50$        
External DVD burner 174.99$      
HP Laserjet 9000dn 3,434.00$   
HP Laserjet 9050dn 3,239.78$   
Usb cable for an Epson Photopc 3000Z 3.78$          

 Infinite 
Source  Zones  MicroAge 

90.22$      No Bid 91.19$       
20.35$      22.15$       21.31$       

No Bid No Bid 14.84$       
182.50$    188.57$     191.00$     

No Bid 20.16$       20.30$       
32.24$      33.70$       33.08$       
24.70$      25.91$       24.92$       

264.00$    264.05$     262.00$     
29.00$      27.76$       27.67$       
29.00$      27.76$       27.67$       
29.00$      27.76$       27.67$       
29.00$      28.88$       27.67$       

182.00$    174.99$     186.00$     
3,434.00$ No Bid No Bid

No Bid 3,447.16$  3,276.90$  
No Bid 5.05$         4.00$         
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