Item # Item Description

1 HP Photosmart 8450

2 Replacement Lamp for Hitachi Projector

3 Replacement Lamp for Panasonic Projector
4 2,000 sheet input tray base for HP 9050dn
5 3,000 sheet stapler/stacker

6 Hamilton Millenium Headphone

7 Telex Odyssey Headphone

8 Labsonic HD stereo headphone

9 HP LaserJet C8543X Black Print Cartridge

Q042105.xIs

Low Price

B PGB H PR B P

195.00
350.82
313.33
757.00
1,548.63
24.79
27.00
9.72
195.58

Techdepot

$

195.00

No Bid

$
$

325.00
910.00

$ 1,795.00
No Bid

$

30.00

No Bid

$

236.00

GRAND PRAIRIE INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
GPISD PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

Zones

$ 214.69
$ 350.82
$ 313.33
$ 786.00
$ 1,548.63
No Bid

$ 28.88
No Bid

$ 195.58
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QUOTE # Q042105

SCW Highsmith Tree
$ 204.00 No Bid $
$ 399.00 NoBid No Bid
$ 317.62 NoBid No Bid
$ 773.00 NoBid $
$ 1,793.00 No Bid $
No Bid $ 24.79 No Bid
$ 30.00 $ 33.89 No Bid
$ 9.72 No Bid No Bid
$ 234.53 NoBid $

House

211.63

799.00
1,660.00

214.00

West Tech

$ 203.00
No Bid
$ 332.50
$ 770.00
$ 1,632.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$ 230.00

HiEd Inc.

207.00
511.00
331.00
773.00
1,632.00

o Bid
31.00

o Bid

P ZHZH BB R P

240.00

GovConnect

$ 202.00
No Bid

$ 318.00
$ 822.00
$ 1,644.00
No Bid

$ 27.00
No Bid

$ 219.00

4/28/2005



Item # Item Description

1 HP Photosmart 8450

2 Replacement Lamp for Hitachi Projector

3 Replacement Lamp for Panasonic Projector
4 2,000 sheet input tray base for HP 9050dn
5 3,000 sheet stapler/stacker

6 Hamilton Millenium Headphone

7 Telex Odyssey Headphone

8 Labsonic HD stereo headphone

9 HP LaserJet C8543X Black Print Cartridge

Q042105.xIs

Low Price

e R R R A e

195.00
350.82
313.33
757.00
1,548.63
24.79
27.00
9.72
195.58

$
No Bid
$
$
$
No Bid
$
No Bid
$

SHI
201.00
320.00
757.00

1,622.00
28.00

211.00

M& A Infinite Source
$ 20850 $ 209.71
No Bid No Bid
No Bid $ 320.00
$ 846.15 $ 855.00
$ 1,640.75 $ 1,775.00
No Bid $ 25.50
$ 3050 $ 28.00
No Bid No Bid
$ 23250 $ 234.00
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Comp Tech

$ 204.00
No Bid

$ 316.00
$ 799.00
$ 1,593.00
No Bid

$ 27.00
No Bid

$ 226.00

P HH R DR P

Comp Express

215.00
565.00
319.00
829.00
1,732.00
52.00
42.00
29.00
235.00

BCS

$ 235.52
No Bid
No Bid
$ 895.23
$1,778.98
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$ 249.53

4/28/2005



