
Item # Item Description Low Price CDW-G Zones HiEd  West  BCS  SCW  SHI 
 Tech 
depot  M&A 

 Computer 
Tech 

 Gov 
Connect 

 Micro 
System  Troxell 

1 Elmo Document camera 1,286.00$ 1,380.00$  2,175.00$   1,504.00$  NO BID 2,254.76$  2,116.60$  2,200.00$  1,294.70$  1,373.12$  2,139.00$    1,286.00$  1,339.00$   1,336.15$  
2 Palm One Tungsten E 177.00$    185.00$     179.99$      194.00$     186.00$ 187.62$     181.16$     181.00$     181.25$     182.35$     178.00$       179.00$     177.00$      NO BID
3 InFocus X2 Projector 705.00$    773.00$     705.00$      826.00$     776.00$ 862.16$     748.97$     774.00$     2,276.76$  774.00$     765.00$       731.00$     762.00$      866.35$     
4 HP 1100 Toner Cartridge 45.00$      NO BID 50.44$        53.00$       52.00$   49.55$       49.68$       46.00$       53.37$       50.28$       49.00$         49.00$       45.00$        NO BID
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