GRAND PRAIRIE INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
GPISD PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

QUOTE # Q051705
Computer Computer Gov
Item # Item Description Low Price  Zones SHI  West Tech SCW Express PC Mall HiEd Techdepot Tech Connection M&A
1 HP Laserjet 2420 $ 478.00 $522.27 $481.00 $ 491.00 $491.00 $ 51159 $ 51245 $491.00 $ 511.00 $ 51500 % 489.20 $519.76
2 Palmone Tungsten E2 $ 21061 $215.63 $216.00 $ 227.00 | $210.61 $ 21829 $ 216.58 $231.00 $ 217.00 $ 21500 $ 211.81 $215.04
3 NEC DTR-16D-1(BK) Phones $ - NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 NEC PA-16ELCJ-B STA Cards $ - NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 Plantronics Headsets $ 159.00 $166.03 $166.00 $ 173.00 $170.74 $ 166.35 NOBID $184.00 $ 170.00 $ 173.00 $ 168.85 $168.44
6 Lifter $ 4431 $ 51.00 $ 52.00 $ 52.00 $ 50.09 $ 52.60 NO BID $ 49.00 $ 57.00 $ 50.00 $ 4431 $ 49.65
7 Plantronics Earbud $ 1449 $ 1499 $ 16.00 $ 23.00 $ 1476 $ 16.75 NOBID $ 15.00 $ 29.00 $ 15.00 $ 16.38 $ 14.63
8 RhinoSkin Hardcase for Palm Tungsten $ 1897 $ 2160 $ 21.00 $ 27.00 $ 2225 $ 2515 '$ 18.97 $ 20.00 $ 29.00 $ 19.00 NO BID NO BID
9 Tungsten E2 Keyboard $ 3341 $ 4707 $ 4700 $ 5200 $ 46.14 $ 4954 '$ 3341 $ 4700 $ 46.00 $ 46.00 $ 46.72 $ 46.17
10 Tungsten E2 Cradle Kit $ 2596 $ 2699 $ 27.00 $ 33.00 $ 26.26 $ 3034 $ 2596 $ 28.00 $ 34.00 NOBID $ 27.63 $ 26.31
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Infinite Best

Source of Tree Micro System Computer
Item # Item Description Low Price Dallas House Engineering Supplies

1 HP Laserjet 2420 $ 47800 $ 505.00 $ 495.00 $ 478.00 $ 526.08
2 Palmone Tungsten E2 $ 21061 $ 218.00 NO BID $ 211.00 $  220.39
3 NEC DTR-16D-1(BK) Phones $ - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 NEC PA-16ELCJ-B STA Cards $ - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 Plantronics Headsets $ 159.00 $ 173.00 NO BID $ 159.00 $ 177.25
6 Lifter $ 4431 $ 45.00 NO BID $ 51.00 $ 48.25
7 Plantronics Earbud $ 1449 $ 15.75 NO BID $ 16.00 | $ 14.49
8 RhinoSkin Hardcase for Palm Tungsten $ 18.97 $ 20.78 NOBID $ 19.00 NOBID
9 Tungsten E2 Keyboard $ 3341 $ 46.33 NO BID $ 46.00 $ 47.37
10 Tungsten E2 Cradle Kit $ 2596 $ 27.39 NOBID $ 26.00 NOBID
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