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1 | 60 pk CD-R Spindle, 50/pkg. Verbatim Fuji Photo Memorex Fuiji Buslink Memorex Memorex Memorex Verbatim Office Depot
NO BID 94691 32024563 NO BID 32024563 32024563 94691 678120
#109315  [Brand Bid: $11.46 $13.67 $9.80 $11.00 $9.85 $10.74 $14.00 $11.50 $10.00 $8.71
2 1312 bx Diskette, 3.5, DSHD, formatted, 10/bx; Verbatim Verbatim Memorex Maxell Maxell Imation Imation Memorex Verbatim Office Depot
Xerox 8R7626 or equal 87410 NO BID 32106000 NO BID 556437 44766 32103661CP6 87410 405891
#109326  [Brand Bid: $1.81 $2.06 $2.56 $2.15 $1.87 $4.00 $2.95 $3.50 $3.00 $1.68
3 | 12ea Toner, Brother 1240, #TN460 for copier/printer Nectron Brother Brother Brother MSE Brother Brother Brother Brother Brother Brother
Yield: Y:6,000 Y:6.5K Y:6K Y:6K pgs Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K
#109333  [Brand Bid: $32.00 $55.46 $52.61 $55.19 $53.43 $46.00 $43.59 $54.00 $59.00 $60.00 $57.50 $54.79
4 | 6ea Drum Type Cartridge; Brother, for fax; Nectron Brother Brother Brother Brother Brother Brother Brother Brother Brother Brother
#DR400, 8300, 8600, 4750; Yield: Y:20,000 Y:20K Y:20K Y:20K Y:20K Y:20K Y:20K Y:20K Y:20K Y:20K Y:20K
#109334  [Brand Bid: $64.00 $109.66 $101.46 $106.71 $102.39 $117.00 $108.23 $104.00 $112.00 $117.00 $112.00 $110.59
5 | 10ea Ink Cartridge HP DeskJet 1600, black; HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
HP#51645A Yield: Y:835 Y:833 Y:833 pgs Y:833 Y:833 Y:833 Y:833 ? Y:833 Y:833
#109382  [Brand Bid: $22.85 $23.06 $23.56 $24.64 $24.64 $26.00 $24.75 $24.10 $28.27 $29.00 $26.25 $24.32
6 | 8ea Ink Cartridge Lexmark 4079, black; #1380490 Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Yield: NO BID Y:205 Y:205 pgs Y:205 Y:205 Y:205 Y:205 ? Y:205 Y:205
#109386  |Brand Bid: $26.26 $23.48 $23.54 $23.34 $28.00 $24.43 $24.36 $30.66 $29.00 $25.00 $29.54
7 1300 ea Mouse, USB, optical, 2-button, scroll wheel, Logitech Logitech Logitech Belkin Aopen Microsoft Belkin Logitech Belkin Logitech
Logitech or equal NO BID 931222 911530-0403 | 930808-0403 NO BID 0-75B F8E814-BLK | 930808-0403 | FBE814-OPT 906805
#109391  [Brand Bid: $8.16 $5.41 $20.75 $9.59 $6.00 $9.99 $8.00 $26.00 $10.29 $15.90
8 | 30ea Ink Cartridge for Optic Reader, black, HP92261A HP (discontinued) HP51604A ? HP HP
Yield: NO BID Y:500 NO BID HP51604A NO BID NO BID Y:500 Y:500 NO BID NO BID Y:500 Y:?
#109394  [Brand Bid: $12.56 $9.65 $10.46 $9.80 $10.25 $9.50
9 | 38ea Toner Cartridge for Lexmark Optra S, #1382925; (prints 17.6K pgs) Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark MSE Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Bid only HP, Lexmark, Cannon, or Xerox products and a Y:17,600 Y:17,600 Y:17,600 pg Y:17,600 Y:17,600 Y:17,600 Y:17,600 Y:17,600 Y:17,600 Y:17,600 Y:17,600
district-approved compatible; Yield & Brand Bid: $173.25 $188.46 $180.34 $174.89 $182.82 $78.00 $183.79 $179.00 $202.00 $197.00 $196.00 $183.51
Alternate: Nectron Amazon Office Depot
#109400  [Brand Bid: $58.00 $86.78 $92.28
10 | 20ea Toner Cartridge for HP LaserJet 5SI, C3909A; Bid only HP, Xerox 6R906 HP Xerox 6R906 HP MSE Xerox 6R906 HP HP HP HP HP
Lexmark, Cannon, or Xerox products & a district-approved Y:16,500 Y:15K Y:15K Y:15K Y:16,500 Y:15K Y:15K ? Y:15K Y:15K
compatible; Yield & Brand Bid: $87.95 $151.26 $96.81 $158.52 $150.90 $82.00 $97.73 $153.00 $171.00 $152.00 $169.00 $156.07
Alternate: Nectron 09A Amazon
#109403  [Brand Bid: $48.95 $69.00

Page 1 of 12




QUOTE NUMBER 012706

& ] S s 5 k= » > -
QTY DESCRIPTION % ) ‘g g 2 i é % _§ g 2 E g g2 - Z é s é‘%
o = S = I El S 8 £ £ g = 3 £ z g = @
GPISD # MFG. PART NUMBER b gl @ £ g S 3 g u S5 2 S g £
= o IS) 0] < o =
QTY. DESCRIPTION = =
11| 36ea Ink Cartridge for HP DeskJet 870CXI, color, HP 51641A HP HP 51641A HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
#51641A Yield: Y:460 Y:460 Y:460 pgs Y:461 Y:461 Y:460 Y:461 ? Y:460 Y:460
#109410  [Brand Bid: $23.72 $24.96 $23.91 $25.57 $24.27 $27.00 $25.34 $25.25 $28.98 $29.00 $27.00 $25.24
12 | 12ea SVIDEO Cable, 6' Startech Belkin Startech CTG Belkin Tripp Lite Belkin
NO BID NOBID |SVID2RCAMM| F8V308-06 NO BID NO BID F8V308-06 A012-06 AV22100-06 NO BID
#109411  [Brand Bid: $2.06 $4.29 $4.01 $10.00 $4.95 $9.00 $19.60
13 | 54ea Toner Cartridge HP LaserJet 5L/6L/6LXI/3100, #3906A; Bid only Xerox 6R908 HP 3906A HP HP MSE Xerox 6R928 HP HP HP HP HP
HP, Lexmark, Cannon, or Xerox products and a district-approved Y:? Y:2,500 Y:2,500 pgs Y:2,500 Y:2,500 Y:2,500 Y:2,500 Y:2,500 ? Y:2,500 Y:2,500
compatible; Yield & Brand Bid: $34.20 $54.06 $52.71 $52.70 $38.00 $34.98 $53.80 $61.41 $58.00 $59.90 $55.24
Alternate: Nectron 06A Xerox 6R908 Amazon Office Depot
#109412  [Brand Bid: $24.75 $34.95 $56.11 $36.25 $28.84
14 | 48ea Toner Cartridge for HP5000N, C4129X; Bid only HP, Lexmark, Xerox 6R925 HP HP C4129X HP MSE Xerox 6R925 HP HP HP HP HP
Cannon, or Xerox products and a district-approved compatible Y:10,000 Y:10K Y:10K pgs Y:10K Y:10K Y:10K Y:10K Y:10K Y:10K Y:10K Y:10K
Yield: Brand Bid: $82.00 $128.96 $126.93 $133.46 $85.00 $83.85 $129.00 $146.00 $129.00 $144.00 $133.03
Alternate: Nectron 29X Amazon Office Depot
#109413  [Brand Bid: $52.00 $135.11 $78.50 $64.72
15 |100 ea Ink Cartridge for Epson 740, black; S020189; Epson S189108Epson S189108 (discontinued) Epson Future Graphic4Epson S189108 Epson S189108Radian RK9189 Epson Epson
Bid Epson or a compatible quality; Y:? Y:900 NOBID  |Epson S189108 Y:900 Y:900 Y:900 ? Y:900 Y:900
Yield: Brand Bid: $19.10 $21.16 $19.84 $19.21 $13.01 $19.50 $22.00 $7.00 $20.79 $19.47
Alternate: Nectron Amazon 2-pk
#109416  [Brand Bid: $0.90 $15.79
16 | 24ea Ink Cartridge color for Epson 740; S020191 Epson $191089 Epson S19108|Epson S02019Y (discontinued) Epson Future Graphic§Epson S$191089 Epson Epson Radian Tech. Epson Epson
Bid Epson or a compatible quality; Y:? Y:900 Epson S191089 Y:300 Y:300 Y:300 Y:900 ? Y:900 Y:300
Yield: Brand Bid: $19.20 $21.16 $21.12 $19.92 $19.21 $13.01 $20.59 $20.00 $22.00 $7.00 $21.40 $19.47
Alternate: Nectron Rhinotek
#109417  |Brand Bid: $1.75 $8.72
17 | 84 ea Toner Cartridge for HP LaserJet 2100; C4096A; Bid only HP, Xerox 6R928 HP Xerox 6R928 HP MSE Xerox 6R928 HP HP HP HP HP
Lexmark, Cannon, or Xerox products and a district-approved Y:5,000 Y:5K Y:5K Y:5K Y:5K Y:5K Y:5K Y:5K Y:5K
compatible; Yield & Brand Bid: $60.84 $78.86 $62.40 $82.73 $81.83 $60.30 $62.63 $78.75 $89.00 $81.00 $88.20 $81.45
Alternate: Nectron 96A Amazon
#109418  [Brand Bid: $35.00 $52.00
18 | 30ea Toner Cartridge for HP LaserJet 4500N; black; C4191A; Bid only HP C4191A HP HP C4191A HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
HP, Lexmark, Cannon, or Xerox products and a district-approved Y:9,000 Y:9K Y:9K pgs Y:9K Y:9K Y:9K Y:9K ? Y:9K Y:9K
compatible; Yield & Brand Bid: $66.10 $68.26 $66.52 $70.81 $67.39 $75.19 $68.24 $68.00 $77.23 $69.00 $76.99 $69.72
Alternate: Nectron Verbatim
#109419  [Brand Bid: $35.00 $43.68
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19| 20ea Toner Cartridge for HP LaserJet 4500N; cyan; C4192A; Bid only HP HP HP C4192A HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
HP, Lexmark, Cannon, or Xerox products and a district-approved Y:6,000 Y:6K Y:6K pgs Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K ? Y:6K Y:6K
compatible; Yield & Brand Bid: $93.60 $98.06 $96.55 $102.78 $97.81 $109.00 $99.45 $98.50 $110.00 $99.00 $110.96 $101.19
Alternate: Nectron Verbatim
#109420  |Brand Bid: $46.00 $58.00
20 | 20ea Toner Cartridge for HP LaserJet 4500N; magenta; C4193A; Bid HP C4193A HP HP C4193A HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
only HP, Lexmark, Cannon, or Xerox products and a district- Y:6,000 Y:6K Y:6K pgs Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K ? Y:6K Y:6K
approved compatible; Yield & Brand Bid: $93.60 $98.06 $96.55 $102.78 $97.79 $109.00 $99.45 $98.25 $110.00 $99.00 $110.96 $101.19
Alternate: Nectron 93A Verbatim
#109421  |Brand Bid: $46.00 $59.00
21 | 20ea Toner Cartridge for HP LaserJet 4500N; yellow; C4194A; Bid HP C4194A HP HP 4194A HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
only HP, Lexmark, Cannon, or Xerox products and a district- Y:6,000 Y:6K Y:6K pgs Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K ? Y:6K Y:6K
approved compatible; Yield & Brand Bid: $93.60 $98.06 $96.55 $102.78 $97.78 $109.00 $99.45 $98.25 $110.00 $99.00 $110.96 $101.19
Alternate: Nectron 94A Rhinotek
#109422  |Brand Bid: $46.00 $77.86
22 | 12ea Toner Cartridge for HP Color LaserJet 8500/8550, cyan; C4150A; HP C4150A HP HP C4150A HP MSE HP HP HP HP HP HP
Bid only HP, Lexmark, Cannon, or Xerox products and a Y:8,500 Y:8,500 Y:8,500 pgs Y:8,500 Y:8,500 Y:8,500 Y:8,500 ? Y:8,500 Y:8,500
district-approved compatible; Yield & Brand Bid: $137.95 $140.76 $137.20 $146.02 $138.96 $119.00 $142.16 $140.00 $158.00 $141.00 $160.00 $143.77
Alternate: Nectron 50A Verbatim
#109425  |Brand Bid: $84.00 $93.00
23| 8ea Toner Cartridge for HP Color LaserJet 8500/8550, magenta; HP C4151A HP HP C4151A HP MSE HP HP HP HP HP HP
C4151A,; Bid only HP, Lexmark, Cannon, or Xerox products and Y:8,500 Y:8,500 Y:8,500 pgs Y:8,500 Y:8,500 Y:8,500 Y:8,500 ? Y:8,500 Y:8,500
a district-approved compatible; Yield & Brand Bid: $137.95 $140.76 $137.20 $146.02 $138.93 $119.00 $142.16 $140.00 $158.00 $141.00 $160.00 $143.77
Alternate: Nectron 51A ?
#109426  |Brand Bid: $84.00 $96.00
24 (1500 ea Ink Cartridge for HP DeskJet 840C, No. 15 black; HP C6615DN HP HP C6615DN HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
C6615DN; Deliver 1000 now; 500 April; Yield: Y:600 Y:603 Y:603 pgs Y:603 Y:603 Y:630 Y:603 ? Y:603 Y:603
#109428  |Brand Bid: $21.45 $22.06 $21.76 $23.27 $22.37 $24.99 $22.66 $22.00 $26.85 $25.00 $23.99 $22.97
25 |700 ea Ink Cartridge for HP DeskJet 840C, No. 17 HP HP HP C6625AN HP HP HP ? HP HP ? HP
Tri-color, C6625AN; Deliver 500 now; 200 April; Yield: Y:430 Y:410 Y:410 pgs Y:430 Y:410 Y:410 Y:410 ? Y:410 Y:430
#109429  |Brand Bid: $23.82 $24.36 $23.91 $25.57 $24.35 $26.99 $24.85 $24.50 $29.29 $26.00 $29.97 $25.24
26 | 9ea Toner Cartridge for HP LaserJet 8100DN & 8150-DN, black; Xerox 6R929 HP HP C4182X HP MSE HP HP HP HP HP HP
C4182X; Bid HP, Lexmark, Cannon, or Xerox products and a Y:20,000 Y:20K Y:20K pgs Y:20K Y:20K Y:20K Y:20K Y:20K Y:20K Y:20K
district-approved compatible; Yield & Brand Bid: $97.75 $148.26 $146.00 $155.43 $147.88 $90.00 $151.31 $151.00 $168.00 $150.00 $168.00 $153.02
Alternate: Nectron 82X Amazon
#109430  |Brand Bid: $62.00 $100.00
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27 | 18ea Drum Kit HP4500, C4195A HP C4195A HP HP C4195A HP HP HP HP HP HP Y:6250 HP
$62.68 $65.26 $63.58 $67.69 $64.41 $70.00 $65.90 $66.00 $71.39 $69.00 $72.40 $66.64
Alternate: Nectron 95A
#109433  [Brand Bid: $54.00
28 | 12ea Svideo Cable, 12' ea Cables to Go Belkin Startech CTG Startech Tripp Lite Belkin
NO BID NO BID #02308 F8V308-12-M NO BID NO BID SVIDEOMM12| A012-012 | AV21100Q12 NO BID
#109434  [Brand Bid: $4.68 $10.52 $5.54 $14.00 $7.95 $9.00 $10.69
29| 8ea Transfer Kit, HP4500, C4196A HP C4196A HP HP C4196A HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Y:25K pgs Y:25K
#109435  [Brand Bid: $163.00 $169.86 $167.22 $178.02 $169.47 $189.00 $173.30 $173.50 $188.00 $174.00 $186.00 $252.86
30 | 12ea Toner HP1200, C7115A, ea HP C7115A HP Xerox HP MSE Xerox 6R932 HP HP HP HP HP
Bid only HP, Lexmark, Cannon, or Xerox products and a Y:2,500 Y:2500 6R932 Y:4,200 Y:3,500 Y:2,500 Y:2,500 Y:2,500 Y:2,500 Y:2,500
district-approved compatible; Yield & Brand Bid: $47.30 $48.96 $50.81 $50.76 $52.31 $56.00 $51.08 $49.50 $55.72 $53.00 $54.29 $52.98
Alternate: Nex Y:3,500 Amazon
#109436  |Brand Bid: $36.00 $42.50
31| 4dea Drum Kit, HP8500/50 Color, C4153A HP C4153A HP HP C4153A HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Y:12,500 Y:12,500
#109438  [Brand Bid: $122.75 $123.76 $121.86 $129.73 $123.38 $139.00 $129.30 $127.00 $137.00 $129.00 $139.00 $127.72
32| 36ea Color Ink #78 for HP3820, C6578DN HP C6578DN HP HP C6578DN HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Yield: Y:450 Y:450 pgs Y:450 Y:450 Y:450 Y:450 ? Y:450 Y:450
#109439  [Brand Bid: $25.72 $25.96 $25.97 $27.65 $27.36 $29.19 $27.42 $27.25 $29.31 $29.00 $29.00 $27.29
33| 5ea HP Color LaserJet 4600 series smart print cartridge, black, Xerox 6R941 HP HP C9720A HP MSE HP HP HP HP C9720A HP HP
C9720A,; Bid only HP, Lexmark, Cannon, or Xerox products Y:9,000 Y:9K Y:9K pgs Y:9K Y:9K Y:9K Y:9K Y:8K Y:8K Y:9K
and a district-approved compatible; Yield & Brand Bid: $99.95 $121.96 $120.09 $127.84 $121.52 $121.00 $127.76 $124.00 $138.00 $82.00 $136.00 $125.87
Alternate: Nectron 20A Verbatim
#109440  [Brand Bid: $98.00 $101.00
34| 4ea HP Color LaserJet 4600 series smart print cartridge, yellow, Xerox 6R943 HP HP C9722A HP MSE HP HP HP HP C9722A HP HP
C9722A,; Bid only HP, Lexmark, Cannon, or Xerox products Y:8,000 Y:8K Y:8K pgs Y:8K Y:8K Y:8K Y:8K ? Y:9K Y:8K
and a district-approved compatible; Yield & Brand Bid: $126.95 $164.06 $162.48 $172.97 $164.54 $134.00 $127.76 $167.50 $185.00 $167.00 $181.00 $170.30
Alternate: Nectron 22A Verbatim
#109441  [Brand Bid: $110.00 $117.50
3B | 2ea HP Color LaserJet 4600 series smart print cartridge, cyan, Xerox 6R942 HP HP C9721A HP MSE HP HP HP HP HP HP
C9721A,; Bid only HP, Lexmark, Cannon, or Xerox products Y:8,000 Y:8K Y:8K pgs Y:8K Y:8K Y:8K Y:8K ? Y:8K Y:8K
and a district-approved compatible; Yield & Brand Bid: $126.95 $164.06 $163.28 $172.97 $164.51 $134.00 $127.76 $167.50 $185.00 $167.00 $185.00 $170.30
Alternate: Nectron 21A Verbatim
#109442  |Brand Bid: $110.00 $117.50
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36 1550 ea Ink cartridge HP DeskJet 3650 black #27, C8727A HP C8727A HP HP C8727AN HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Yield: Y:220 Y:220 Y:220 pgs Y:220 Y:220 Y:220 Y:220 ? Y:220 Y:220
#109446  |Brand Bid: $14.21 $14.76 $14.14 $15.25 $14.51 $16.79 $14.84 $14.68 $18.33 $20.00 $17.00 $15.01
37 [348 ea Ink cartridge HP DeskJet 3650 black, color ink #28, C8728A HP C8728A HP HP C8728AN HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Yield: Y:190 Y:190 Y:190 pgs Y:190 Y:190 Y:190 Y:190 ? Y:190 Y:190
#109447  |Brand Bid: $16.62 $17.06 $16.96 $17.88 $17.01 $19.39 $17.40 $17.15 $21.06 $23.00 $18.80 $17.60
38 | 18ea Toner HP 2300, Q2610A, each; Bid only HP, Lexmark, Cannon, Xerox 6R936 HP HP Q2610A HP MSE HP HP HP HP HP HP
or Xerox products and a district-approved compatible Y:6,000 Y:6K Y:6K pgs Y:6K Y:6K ? Y:6K ? Y:6K Y:6K
Yield: Brand Bid: $69.30 $94.46 $93.01 $99.02 $94.23 $84.00 $96.40 $95.00 $106.00 $97.00 $106.00 $97.49
Alternate: Nectron 10A Verbatim
#109448  |Brand Bid: $54.00 $73.00
39| 20ea Toner HP 4300, Q1339A, each; Bid only HP, Lexmark, Cannon, Xerox 6R985 HP HP Q1339A HP MSE HP HP HP HP HP HP
or Zerox products and a district-approved compatible Y:18,000 Y:18K Y:18K pgs Y:18K Y:18K ? Y:18K ? Y:18K Y:18K
Yield: Brand Bid: $114.95 $158.66 $157.77 $167.96 $159.81 $109.00 $163.51 $160.50 $183.00 $160.00 $179.00 $165.36
Alternate: Nectron ?
#109449  [Brand Bid: $92.00 $112.50
40 | 20 ea Toner HP 1300, Q2613A, each; Bid only HP, Lexmark, Cannon, Xerox 6R957 HP HP Q2613A HP MSE Xerox 6R957 HP HP HP HP HP
or Xerox products and a district-approved compatible Y:4,000 Y:2,500 Y:2,500 pgs Y:3K Y:4K Y:2,500 Y:2,500 ? Y:2,500 Y:2,500
Yield: Brand Bid: $49.45 $56.26 $55.34 $58.91 $56.05 $56.19 $51.98 $57.00 $64.68 $59.00 $63.00 $58.00
Alternate: Nectron 13X Verbatim
#109450  [Brand Bid: $40.00 $50.00
41| 6ea Toner HP 2420, A6511A, each; Bid only HP, Lexmark, Cannon, HP Q6511A | HP Q6511A HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
or Xerox products and a district-approved compatible Y:6,000 Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K
Yield: Brand Bid: $93.70 $96.96 NO BID $102.16 $96.82 $109.65 $102.45 $99.00 $108.00 $102.00 $109.00 $106.61
Alternate: Nectron 11A
#109452  [Brand Bid: $83.00
42 | 5ea Toner HP 4350, Q5942A, each; Bid only on HP, Lexmark, HP Q5942A HP HP Q5942A HP MSE HP HP HP HP HP HP
Cannon, or Xerox products and a district-approved compatible Y:10,000 Y:10K Y:20K Y:10K Y:10K Y:10K Y:10K Y:10K Y:10K
Yield: Brand Bid: $115.20 $116.66 $115.39 $122.84 $116.82 $115.00 $123.19 $119.00 $130.00 $121.00 $131.00 $120.94
Alternate: Nectron
#109453  [Brand Bid: $65.00
43 | 20ea Ink HP DeskJet 3940, #21, C9351AN HP C9351AN HP HP C9351AN HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Yield: Y:150 Y:150 Y:150 Y:150 ? Y:150 ? Y:150 ?
#109454  [Brand Bid: $11.85 $13.16 $11.81 $12.71 $12.09 $14.05 $12.97 $12.50 $13.50 $16.00 $13.69 $12.51
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44 | 10ea Ink HP DeskJet 3940 Tri-Color, #22, C9352AN HP C9352AN HP HP C9352AN HP HP HP HP HP HP HP HP
Yield: Y:138 Y:138 Y:138 Y:138 ? Y:150 ? Y:140 ?
#109455  [Brand Bid: $13.65 $15.16 $13.81 $14.64 $13.93 $16.99 $15.05 $14.32 $15.54 $18.00 $15.89 $14.40
45| 9ea Dongle, Matrox Output A/V Cable, each Belkin
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID AV22102-03 NO BID
#492141 Brand Bid: $12.00
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1 | 60 pk Memorex Fuiji Spindle
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
#109315 $9.40 $10.70 $13.99 $8.20 $10.74
2 1312 bx Maxell TDK TDK Imation
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
#109326 $1.65 $1.89 $1.99 $4.47 $1.42 $3.25
3 | 12ea Brother Brother Brother Brother Nectron IOP
Y:6K Y:6K NO BID Y:6K NO BID Y:6K Hi Yield Y:6K
#109333 $52.23 $53.26 $55.00 $51.99 $44.00 $56.87 $57.53 $39.00 $22.45
4 | 6ea Brother Brother Brother Brother Nectron IOP
Y:20K Y:20K NO BID Y:20K NO BID Y:2K Y:20K Y:20K
#109334 $100.71 $102.70 $104.89 $105.63 $89.00 $115.93 $103.49 $69.00 $65.58
5] 10ea HP HP HP HP Nectron IOP
Y833 Y:833 NO BID Y:833 NO BID Y:833
#109382 $23.98 $24.44 $25.00 $23.73 $22.82 $25.87 $25.18 $9.99 $12.18
6 | 8ea Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark
Y:205 Y:205 NO BID Y:205 NO BID NO BID Y:205 NO BID Y:205
#109386 $23.41 $23.30 $24.00 $23.49 $24.71 $25.17 $33.14
7 1300 ea Key Tronic Logitech Logitech Logitech
NO BID 3-button NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
#109391 $5.68 $7.00 $7.60 $11.00 $9.87 $10.49
8 | 30ea HP HP QuietJet
Y:2K NO BID NO BID Y:500 NO BID NO BID Y:500 NO BID NO BID
#109394 $9.44 $9.75 $11.99 $10.21 $10.52
9 | 38ea Lexmark Lexmark Lexmark NER Lexmark Nectron Lexmark
Y:17,600 Y:17,600 Y:17,600 Y:17,600 Y:17,600 Y:17,600 Y:17,600
$170.71 $183.18 NO BID $172.47 $243.99 $169.99 $95.00 $195.43 $187.20 $70.00 $260.51
0P
#109400 $59.10
10 | 20 ea HP HP Xerox 6R906 HP HP NER HP Nectron HP
Y:15K Y:15K Y:16,500 Y:15K Y:15K Y:19,500 Y:15K Y:15K
$152.77 $155.79 $97.50 $157.54 $180.98 $148.20 $78.00 $165.19 $128.39 $65.00 $221.56
ActionLaser IOP
#109403 $55.00 $59.55
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11| 36ea HP HP HP HP Nectron IOP
Y:460 Y:461 NO BID Y:460 NO BID Y:461 Y:461
#109410 $24.90 $25.13 $26.00 $31.99 $24.06 $26.86 $27.83 $17.00 $14.79
12 | 12ea StarTech.com Belkin Belkin Minidin4 Belkin
NO BID 12' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
#109411 $2.70 $3.28 $4.58 $22.99 $3.49 $4.04
13 | bdea HP HP Xerox 6R908 HP 1JW-HP NER HP Nectron HP
Y:2,500 Y:2,500 Y:2,500 Y:2,500 Y:2,500 Y:2,500 Y:2,500 Y:2,500
$54.63 $55.00 $32.29 $55.00 $46.99 $52.91 $44.00 $58.48 $32.20 $29.00 $78.43
IOP
#109412 $21.78
14 | 48ea HP HP Xerox 6R925 HP HP NER HP Nectron HP
Y:10K Y:10K Y:10K Y:10K Y:10K Y:1K Y:10K Y:10K
$128.92 $132.79 $88.67 $132.28 $154.98 $127.31 $84.00 $140.81 $71.53 $60.00 $188.86
IOP
#109413 $42.28
15 (100 ea Epson Epson S189108 Epson S189108Epson S189108 Epson S189108 Nectron IOP
Y:1K Y:900 NO BID NO BID Y:900
$19.87 $19.53 NO BID $20.15 $24.99 $21.86 $1.21 $1.50 $4.99
#109416
16 | 24ea Epson Epson S$191089 Rhinotek  [Epson S191089 Epson S191089 Nectron IOP
Y:1K Y:300 Y:300 NO BID NO BID Y:300
$19.87 $19.53 NO BID $13.99 $24.99 $21.86 $1.21 $2.25 $5.99
#109417
17 | 84ea HP HP Xerox 6R928 HP HP NER HP Nectron HP
Y:5K Y:5K Y:5K Y:5K Y:5K Y:5K Y:5K Y:5K
$80.54 $81.30 $61.65 $83.00 $79.38 $77.32 $69.00 $86.20 $52.26 $49.00 $115.63
IOP
#109418 $32.18
18 | 30ea HP HP HP HP NER HP Nectron HP
Y:9K Y:9K Y:9K Y:9K Y:9K Y:9K Y:9K
$67.70 $69.60 NO BID $70.50 $68.06 $66.75 $57.00 $73.80 $45.40 $29.00 $98.98
IOP
#109419 $20.07
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19 [ 20ea HP HP HP HP NER HP Nectron HP
Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K
$99.85 $101.00 NO BID $102.00 $98.78 $96.84 $74.00 $107.13 $69.12 $45.00 $143.68
IOP
#109420 $35.29
20 | 20ea HP HP HP HP NER HP Nectron HP
Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K
$99.85 $101.00 NO BID $102.00 $98.78 96.84 $74.00 $107.12 $68.89 $45.00 $143.67
IOP
#109421 $35.29
21 | 20ea HP HP HP HP NER HP Nectron HP
Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K
$99.85 $101.00 NO BID $102.00 $98.78 $96.84 $74.00 $107.11 $66.52 $45.00 $143.65
IOP
#109422 $35.29
22 | 12ea HP HP HP HP NER HP Nectron HP
Y:8,500 Y:8,500 Y:8,500 Y:8,500 Y:8,500 Y:8,500 Y:8,500
$139.63 $143.50 NO BID $145.15 $140.35 $139.37 $131.00 $152.16 $95.60 $95.00 $204.09
IOP
#109425 $59.99
23| 8ea HP HP HP HP NER HP Nectron HP
Y:8,500 Y:8,500 Y:8,500 Y:8,500 Y:8,500 Y:8,500 Y:8,500
$139.63 $143.50 NO BID $145.15 $140.35 $139.37 $131.00 $153.34 $95.60 $95.00 $204.09
IOP
#109426 $59.99
24 11500 ea HP HP HP HP Nectron IOP
Y:603 Y:603 NO BID Y:603 NO BID Y:603 Y:603
#109428 $22.61 $23.00 $24.00 $22.25 $21.45 $24.44 $15.06 $9.00 $7.98
25 [700 ea HP HP HP HP Nectron IOP
Y:410 Y:410 NO BID Y:410 NO BID Y:410 Y:410
#109429 $24.84 $25.13 $24.00 $23.99 $23.86 $26.86 $27.78 $16.99 $16.31
26 | 9ea HP HP Xerox 6R929 HP HP NER HP Nectron HP
Y:20K Y:20K Y:20K Y:20K Y:20K Y:2K Y:15K Y:20K
$150.25 $152.74 $104.75 $154.30 $149.31 $145.28 $131.00 $161.97 $84.73 $69.00 $217.24
ActionLaser IOP
#109430 $59.00 $36.40
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27 | 18ea HP HP HP Y:6250 HP HP HP Nectron IOP
$64.75 $66.52 NO BID $68.00 $64.38 $64.33 $61.00 $70.53 $69.52 $65.00 $42.91
#109433
28 | 12ea StarTech.com Belkin Belkin Belkin
NO BID AV21100Q12 | SVIDEOMM12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
#109434 $3.72 $6.09 $13.00 $5.81 $8.65 $5.67
29| 8ea HP HP HP HP HP HP
NO BID Y:25K NO BID
#109435 $169.41 $174.95 $177.00 $171.79 $170.18 $165.00 $185.50 $181.61 $277.00
30 | 12ea HP HP Xerox 6R932 HP HP NER HP Nectron HP
Y:2,500 Y:2,500 Y:3,500 Y:2,500 Y:2,500 Y:2,500 Y:2,500 Y:2,500
$48.92 $49.88 $46.95 $50.00 $48.77 $47.83 $48.00 $52.91 $43.83 $39.00 $70.95
ActionLaser | IOP Y:3.5K
#109436 $35.00 $37.92
31| 4ea HP HP HP HP HP HP IOP
NO BID Y:12,500 NO BID
#109438 $123.77 $127.48 $128.92 $125.32 $124.18 $120.00 $135.18 $105.97 $96.15
32 | 36ea HP HP HP HP Nectron IOP
Y:450 Y:450 NO BID Y:450 NO BID Y:450 Y:450
#109439 $26.92 $27.17 $29.00 $26.56 $25.83 $28.94 $22.64 $15.99 $14.79
33| 5ea HP HP Xerox 6R941 HP NER HP Nectron HP
Y:9K Y:9K Y:9K Y:9K Y:9K Y:9K Y:9K Y:9K
$124.46 $125.64 $100.68 $127.06 $113.12 $120.73 $116.00 $133.22 $99.24 $128.00 $178.70
IOP
#109440 $68.89
34| 4ea HP HP Xerox 6R943 HP HP NER HP Nectron HP
Y:8K Y:8K Y:8K Y:8K Y:8K Y:8K Y:8K Y:8K
$165.03 $169.98 $121.00 $171.90 $164.51 $163.30 $144.00 $180.25 $123.24 $132.00 $241.77
IOP
#109441 $78.99
35| 2ea HP HP Xerox 6R942 HP HP NER HP Nectron HP
Y:8K Y:8K Y:8K Y:8K Y:8K Y:8K Y:8K Y:8K
$165.03 $169.98 $121.00 $171.90 $164.51 $163.30 $144.00 $180.25 $122.37 $132.00 $241.77
IOP
#109442 $78.99
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36 [550 ea HP HP HP HP Nectron IOP
Y:220 Y:220 NO BID Y:220 NO BID Y:220 Y:220
#109446 $14.85 $14.99 $15.50 $14.29 $14.44 $16.02 $14.70 $17.00 $18.21
37 |348 ea HP HP HP HP HP Nectron IOP
Y:190 Y:190 NO BID Y:190 NO BID Y:190 Y:190
#109447 $17.40 $17.56 $17.75 $16.85 $17.09 $18.77 $19.50 $22.00 $23.13
38 | 18ea HP HP Xerox 6R936 HP HP NER HP Nectron HP
Y:6K Y:6K Y:6,600 Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K
$94.47 $97.30 $70.32 $100.72 $95.18 $93.05 $84.00 $103.18 $73.12 $68.00 $138.40
IOP
#109448 $38.66
39| 20ea HP HP Xerox 6R935 HP HP NER HP Nectron HP
Y:18K Y:18K Y:19,800 Y:18K Y:18K Y:18K Y:18K Y:18K
$160.24 $165.06 $118.19 $166.92 $161.35 $157.06 $138.00 $175.02 $100.83 $120.00 $234.75
IOP
#109449 $94.77
40 | 20 ea HP HP Xerox 6R957 HP HP NER HP Nectron HP
Y:2,500 Y:2,500 Y:4K Y:2,500 Y:2,500 Y:2,500 Y:2,500 Y:4K
$57.19 $57.90 $48.08 $58.54 $56.59 $55.64 $55.00 $61.39 $54.13 $56.00 $82.33
IOP
#109450 $45.63
41| 6ea HP HP HP HP NER Y:12K HP Nectron HP
Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K NO BID Q6511X Y:6K Y:6K Y:6K
$99.21 $100.38 NO BID $102.00 $98.18 $149.00 $106.44 $104.22 $114.00 $142.77
IOP
#109452 $75.99
42 | Sea HP HP Xerox 6R959 HP HP NER HP Nectron HP
Y:10K Y:10K Y:22K Y:10K Y:12K Y:10K Y:10K
$118.76 $120.72 $120.39 $122.09 $118.07 $116.03 $106.00 $128.00 $125.32 $133.00 $171.68
IOP
#109453 $92.22
43 | 20ea HP HP HP HP HP
Y:2K Y:150 NO BID NO BID NO BID Y:150 NO BID Y:150
#109454 $12.37 $12.73 $13.00 $12.21 $13.25 $13.69 $17.77
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44 | 10ea HP HP HP HP HP IoP
Y:2K Y:140 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
#109455 $14.25 $14.66 $15.00 $14.07 $15.25 $15.76 $20.45
45| 9ea Not enough
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID information NO BID NO BID
#492141 NO BID
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