
Item 
# Item Description Low Price CDW-G SHI

 Tech 
Depot  HiEd 

PC Mall 
Gov Camcor Best Buy

Gov 
Connec

Comp 
USA

1 HP2420 Laser printer $404.37 $481.00 $417.60 $440.00 $404.37 $405.60 $468.21 $433.00 $435.29
2 HP2420DN Laser printer duplex/network $603.90 $765.00 $626.20 $650.00 $603.90 $663.25 $724.36 $650.00 $676.47
3 HP2600N Color Laser printer network $327.90 $344.00 $327.90 $350.00 $353.62 $328.00 $346.98 $379.00 $348.94
4 HP3800DN Color Laser printer duplex/network $845.00 $1,125.00 $1,040.10 $845.00 $1,050.83 $1,050.00 $1,098.24 $1,092.00 $1,106.54
5 HP4250DTN B/W Laser Printer $1,246.30 $1,535.00 $1,246.30 $1,550.00 $1,385.53 $1,370.40 $1,774.23 $1,343.00 $1,399.09
6 HP4250N B/W Laser printer $1,082.40 $1,095.00 $1,082.40 $1,110.00 $1,184.72 $1,155.00 $1,245.36 $1,133.00 $1,199.24
7 HP3940 Deskjet printer $41.31 $46.24 $45.20 $49.00 $41.31 $45.20 $48.62 $48.00 $50.00
8 Palmone Tungsten E2 $173.99 $173.99 $175.50 $184.00 $183.29 $176.55 $187.12 $177.00 $185.00
9 LifeDrive Mobile Manager Handheld $335.20 $339.00 $335.20 $344.00 $350.00 $338.00 $382.16 $339.00 $341.00
10 Cradle kit for LifeDrive and E2 $25.00 $25.00 $25.10 $34.00 $28.42 $25.20 $28.67 $27.00 $28.98
11 Universal Wireless Palm keyboard $43.00 $43.00 $43.40 $49.00 $47.36 $43.70 $46.84 $45.00 $53.00
12 Intellisync Handheld Edition for Enterprise $74.30 $77.00 $75.20 $89.00 $77.78 $74.30 $78.00
13 Memorex 1GB USB Flashdrive $23.20 $27.45 $23.20 *19 $34.90 $59.65 $46.43 $44.56 $63.00 $94.48
14 Memorex 2GB USB Flashdrive $42.30 $54.24 $42.30 *39 $59.72 $56.10 $75.93 $82.63 $75.00 $140.00
15 Sony Cybershot DSC-S600 digital camera $175.00 $181.80 $175.00 $186.52 $184.70 $199.28
16 256mb Memory Stick Pro-Duo $25.50 $25.50 $28.60 $33.00 $29.72 $28.35 $33.14 $35.63 $31.00 $43.00
17 Sony - Digital camera accessory kit $23.75 $23.75 $25.70 $28.00 $26.25 $25.30 $29.94 $28.00 $27.99
18 Brother 4750 fax machine $412.00 $420.00 $431.00 $412.00 $499.99 $425.00 $469.23 $428.00 $484.77
19 Sony Camera battery rechargeable $23.64 $25.50 $27.00 $23.64 $28.95
20 Sony Battery Charger (for NP-F330) $32.10 $32.10 $93.00 $89.63 $35.89
21 10' Cat 5 network patch cable $1.52 $1.52 $1.70 $3.00 $1.63 $3.75 $1.55 $3.48
22 25' Cat 5 network patch cable $2.96 $3.27 $3.50 $6.00 $3.71 $6.85 $9.45 $2.96 $5.80
23 6' usb cables $1.50 $1.50 $2.75 $1.84 $3.00 $2.52 $1.55 $3.88
24 EV-200 Mobile Visual Presenter $416.44 $460.00 $457.00 $540.00 $488.74 $416.44 $426.00 $448.36
25 HP5610 Officejet All-In-One $106.00 $109.48 $111.20 $133.00 $120.88 $106.00 $125.48 $139.00 $149.99
26 HP ScanJet 5590 - Flatbed scanner w ADF $229.20 $239.57 $229.20 $245.00 $257.46 $255.00 $279.86 $265.00 $284.78
27 HP Scanjet 4850 $113.30 $124.71 $113.30 $125.00 $129.89 $115.00 $126.51 $149.00 $129.00
28 Plantronics Headset $166.45 $167.40 $221.00 $175.38 $168.00 $166.45 $174.00 $185.99
29 Lifter for Plantronics Headset $43.00 $43.90 $44.32 $43.50 $44.37 $45.00 $48.99
30 Western Digital 7200rpm 40gb Caviar $39.15 $41.47 $48.17 $55.00 $45.43 $39.15 $49.56 $49.95 $48.03
31 Sony Handycam DCR-HC36 - Camcorder $329.61 $329.61 $350.90 $362.00 $375.46 $347.00 $336.85 $365.36 $349.00 $419.97
32 Labtec Stereo 342 - Headset ( semi-open ) $7.12 $7.12 $7.30 $7.95 $7.85 $7.40 $11.64 $8.00 $10.04
33 Epson Powerlite S3 Multimedia projector $599.98 $635.20 $635.00 $668.11 $599.98

* Sony Cybershot DSC-S500 digital camera $161.79 $162.04 $161.79
* Epson Powerlite S4 Multimedia projector $170.00 $594.99 $622.00 $620.00 $170.00

* Alternate product
** Shipping not included
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Nu Image SCW
Action 
Laser Troxell TIG Dop - inc MSE

 Global 
Gov Ed 

$427.00 $414.26 $625.00 $432.00 $487.00 $478.00 $426.52
$630.00 $634.51 $1,081.00 $650.00 $721.00 $766.00 $641.28
$347.00 $339.36 $491.00 $349.00 $399.00 $347.00 $343.69

$1,083.00 $1,076.46 $1,500.00 $1,113.00 $1,225.00 $1,133.00 $1,102.19
$1,410.00 $1,389.70 $1,823.00 $1,450.00 $1,489.00 $1,292.00 $1,426.19
$1,188.00 $1,168.34 $1,536.00 $1,222.00 $1,260.00 $1,089.00 $1,202.13

$47.28 $60.00 $49.00 $75.00 $44.00 $47.03
$179.50 $175.52 $231.00 $178.98 $189.00  NO BID $178.00 $179.93
$343.00 $335.27 $438.00 $344.65 $360.00  NO BID $337.00 $429.27
$28.00 $25.89 $40.00 $26.90 $30.00  NO BID $27.00
$47.00 $50.90 $124.00 $48.44 $48.00 NO BID $45.50
$78.00 $77.88 No Bid $79.00 NO BID $76.00
$33.00 $32.28 $87.00 $63.00 NO BID $33.50 $32.17
$69.00 $65.55 $87.00 $61.00 NO BID $44.50 $56.13

$182.00 $308.78 $231.00 $180.17 $194.00 NO BID
$31.00 $28.63 $40.00 $33.00 NO BID $29.00 $28.44
$29.00 $25.47 $36.00 $30.00 NO BID $25.34

$440.00 $434.66 $567.00 $416.98 $458.00 $510.00 $441.00
$28.81 No Bid NO BID
$115.31 $121.00 $92.00 NO BID $90.00

$3.20 $3.51 No Bid $3.50 NO BID $2.99
$5.90 $3.91 $6.00 NO BID $4.99
$2.15 $1.66 $5.00 $4.50 NO BID $4.99

$1,950.80 No Bid $416.98 NO BID
$131.00 $113.69 $167.00 $114.00 $162.00 $132.00 $126.76
$271.00 $258.43 $333.00 $268.00 $299.00 $235.00 $263.70
$123.00 $117.82 $171.00 $122.00 $155.00 $121.00 $120.47
$171.00 $172.34 $269.00 $169.99 $176.00 NO BID $172.00
$43.00 $49.51 $69.00 $59.99 $48.00 NO BID $49.50
$51.00 $44.50 $61.25 $49.94 $54.00 NO BID $46.50 $47.09

$372.00 $354.84 $500.00 $336.13 $373.00 NO BID $356.61
$7.80 $7.63 No Bid $8.18 $9.00 NO BID $9.00 $8.29

$645.00 $854.00 $629.66 NO BID

$636.33 $655.00 $615.00
** **
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Meridian Life time
Tree 

House
$454.42 $420.00
$683.81 $632.00
$358.00 $338.00

$1,148.00 $1,080.00
$1,524.64 $1,348.00
$1,248.00 $1,185.00

$48.99 $47.50

$29.75
$49.50

$118.54 $143.95
$278.24 $243.00
$126.71 $133.00

$43.90
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